
From: American Journal of Biomedical Science & Research <biomed@biomedgrid.com>
To: 'Mattan Schlomi' <mattanschlomi@aol.com>

Subject: Acceptance for Publication: BM-MRW-20-0749
Date: Wed, Mar 18, 2020 11:05 pm

Attachments: AJBSR.MS.ID.001256.pdf (322K)

Dear Dr. Mattan Schlomi,

Thank you for your response.

We have successfully completed Galley Proof and PDF version of your article entitled with
“Cyllage City COVID-19 Outbreak Linked to Zubat Consumption”. Please find the enclosed
attached PDF of your article and feel free to contact us if any modifications are required.

IF the PDF is acceptable then we will upload in our website. Meanwhile, we humbly request
you to complete payment process of $1179 only to incur Web, media, Web charges etc. which
we have to pay the sum amount for third party services.

Please track the below link to make online payment
https://biomedgrid.com/biomedgrid-pay-online.php

Hope this least contribution is not a big deal to eminent people like you.

Please acknowledge this mail within 24 hours.

Await your optimistic response.

Regards,

Catherine Nichols! American Journal of Biomedical Science

 

From: American Journal of Biomedical Science & Research <biomed@biomedgrid-nl.org>
Sent: 18 March 2020 11:09
To: 'Mattan Schlomi' <mattanschlomi@aol.com>
Subject: Positive Review Comments: BM-MRW-20-0749
Importance: High

 

Dear Dr. Mattan Schlomi,

Hope you are doing well.

Well, we are cheerful to inform you that your manuscript “Cyllage City COVID-19 Outbreak

Linked to Zubat Consumption” has received positive review comments and with your

acceptance we will go ahead for publication.

In meanwhile as we have already informed you that there will be publication charges of your



article is $1179 only, so we appeal you to make payment of $1179 only. Please track the below

link to make online payment

https://biomedgrid.com/biomedgrid-pay-online.php

Please acknowledge this mail within 24 hours, so that we can make the PDF version of your

article.

Hope you understand us.

Await your rapid comeback.

Regards,

Catherine Nichols

American Journal of Biomedical Science & Research | ISSN: 2642-1747

 

From: American Journal of Biomedical Science & Research <biomed@biomedgrid-nl.org>
Sent: 16 March 2020 18:32
To: 'Mattan Schlomi' <mattanschlomi@aol.com>
Subject: RE: Manuscript ID: BM-MRW-20-0749
Importance: High

 

Dear Dr. Mattan Schlomi,

Thank you for your rapid comeback.

Well, we have received your cover letter and your manuscript is under review process, soon we

will get back to you with article updates.

In meanwhile the publication charges for your valuable manuscript is $1179. Pleas track the

below link to make online payment

https://biomedgrid.com/biomedgrid-pay-online.php

Hope this is fine for you and feel free to contact for further queries.

Anticipating promising response.

Regards,

Catherine Nichols

American Journal of Biomedical Science & Research | ISSN: 2642-1747



 

From: Mattan Schlomi <mattanschlomi@aol.com>
Sent: 16 March 2020 17:04
To: biomed@biomedgrid-nl.org
Subject: Re: Manuscript ID: BM-MRW-20-0749

 

Cover Letter attached

 

 

Dr. Mattan Schlomi
mattanschlomi@aol.com

 

 

-----Original Message-----
From: American Journal of Biomedical Science & Research <biomed@biomedgrid-nl.org>
To: mattanschlomi <mattanschlomi@aol.com>
Sent: Mon, Mar 16, 2020 2:56 pm
Subject: Manuscript ID: BM-MRW-20-0749

Dear Dr. Mattan Schlomi,

Thank you for your reply.

We are glad to receive your eminent article for publication in our AJBSR. Our Editorial
Department has carried out with the unique content of your manuscript and we are happy to
inform you that your manuscript has successfully accepted for further review process.

Please use the below manuscript ID for further process
BM-MRW-20-0749: Cyllage City COVID-19 Outbreak Linked to Zubat Consumption.

Please send us the Cover letter of your manuscript. Enclosed is the sample Cover letter.
Moreover, there will be nominal publication charges of towards the publication of manuscript
in our journal website to incur web charges.

Hope you understand us and Soon we will get back to you with article updates.

Please acknowledge this mail within 24 hours.

Await your reply.

Regards,
Catherine Nichols
American Journal of Biomedical Science & Research | ISSN: 2642-1747
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